
BOWL --BASKETObject Name:30320Catalog Number:

Object Condition Report

Other (describe):Same as above

Date

Title (Please print)

Signature

Name (Please print)

CONDITION ON RETURN OF OBJECT:

CONDITION DESCRIBED BY:



BOWL --BASKETObject Name:30320Catalog Number:

Object Condition Report

Exhibit Install - Description from Baskets Exhibit Round 4 condition supplemental.  By Blaser, Andrea.

Condition noted at time of original cataloging in 1980: "Has three repaired cracks, shows re-cracking; needs attention;
inside is dirty." __ __ __ __ __ __Orient with longest tear starting at 12 o’clock.Selvage: Tear in wall starting at 12
o’clock, creating 1cm wide gap. 2cm of off-white accretion starting at 12 o’clock and moving clockwise.  1/2cm loss
starting 2cm from 12 o’clock. 1cm of off white accretion 1cm counterclockwise from 2 o’clock. Tear in wall starting
at 2 o’clock, creating 1cm wide gap. 1cm loss, 3cm counterclockwise from 3 o’clock. 7cm loss starting 2cm clockwise
from 4 o’clock. ½ loss between 6’clock and 7 o’clock. 1/2cm loss at 7 o’clock.  Tear in wall starting 1cm
counterclockwise from 8 o’clock, creating 1/2cm wide gap with fraying. 1/2cm loss at 10 o’clock. 4.5cm loss starting
2 cm from 10 o’clock. 1cm of off white accretion on the left edge of 12 o’clock tear.Interior: Bottom darkened and
discolored, starting from center and extending 11cm in diameter. Several areas of discoloration, possibly accretion, in
the bottom; just above 3 o’clock, 10cm from the center; at 4 o’clock, 4cm from the center, at 5 o’clock starting 7cm
from the center and extending 2.5 cm; 3 areas between 6 o’clock and 7 o’clock, 1mm each, starting 5cm from center;
at 8 o’clock 3cm from center; 1cm counterclockwise from 9 o’clock, 5cm from center. Large tear starting at 12 o’clock
in selvage, 1cm wide, continuing 11cm down basket wall. Evidence of past repair on tear, with stitching across tear,
mostly torn. Last 4cm of tear has intact stitching. Tear starting at 2 o’clock in selvage, 1cm wide, continuing 8cm
down basket wall. Evidence of past repair on tear, with stitching across tear, mostly torn. Last 2.5cm has intact
stitching. Tear starting 1cm counterclockwise from 8 o’clock in selvage, 1/2cm wide, continuing 4cm down basket
wall. Evidence of past repair on tear, with stitching across tear, mostly intact. Top 1.5cm of tear frayed, stitching torn.
Off white accretion in stitching in top of tear. Exterior: Minor abrasion to the weft throughout, causing minor
discoloration. Tears noted in interior visible on exterior, but the stitching noted above is not visible on the exterior,
except through the tear itself. Several small areas of a dark discoloration, possibly accretion, on the weft throughout.
Only warp visible in weight bearing area of base. Old catalog sticker labeled “42” stuck to center of bottom. Basket
cleaned of heavy dust with brushes on 03/13/17. __ __Blaser, Andrea __03/16/2017
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